
 

                 Campsie Childcare Centre - OSHC  

       2019 Autumn Vacation Care 

            15th April – 29th April 2019 

 

Campsie Childcare Centre – OSHC Autumn 

Vacation Care program offers school 

children a wide variety of arts, crafts, games, 

sports and excursions during the NSW 

school holidays. We have age appropriate 

activities in a safe, secure and caring 

environment with staff supervision at all 

time.  
 

The daily fee of $64 and excursion fees          

are eligible to be deductible by Child Care 

Subsidies. The Early Bird discount only 

available for full session $64 daily (7:00 am 

– 6:00pm).   

 

Flexible session hours are available for 

families not needing full day of care.   

Please complete the attached booking form 

indicating your required days for Vacation 

care. 

 

 

 

Please note the program is subject to change 

dependent on enrolment numbers and weather. 

Please ensure your children bring a hat and  

suitable shoes (closed shoes) each day. 

Children will be supervised at the centre  

at a ratio of 1:15 and 1:10 for  

Excursions. 

   

7:00am – 6:00pm 
 

Breakfast and afternoon tea  
 
 

Flexible Session Hours 
Available  

 

$10 off 
for full day session 

 

Register before  

Friday 29 March 2019 

 

 Booking:  

9789 4446  
  

Email: oshc_cccc@cass.org.au 
 

Enrol Now 

Limited Spaces Available  

 



Campsie Childcare Centre - OSHC Vacation Care Program 

Booking Form 

 

Please tick the required days below.    

Bookings must be made by Wednesday 29th March in order to receive the early bird discount.   

 

Date  Program Session 

Start 

Time  

Session 

End time  

Additional 

Cost 

Excursion 

Fee 

Tick 

Box 

Total cost per 

day  

Session Fee + 

Excursion Fee 

Monday 

15th  

Wearable 

Art Day  

      

Tuesday 

16th  

Movies    $22.00   

Wednesday 

17th  

Cooking    $8.00    

Thursday 

18th  

City Tour    $10.00   

Friday 19th  

 

Public Holiday 

Monday 

22nd  

Public Holiday 

Tuesday 

23rd  

Easter Fun 

day  

  $5.00    

Wednesday 

24th  

Kingpin 

Bowling  

   $20.00   

Thursday 

25th  

 

Friday 26th  Nature 

walk  

      

Monday 

29th  

Science 

Day  

 

  $3.00    

 Total Booking Cost. $  

 

Apply $10.00 Discount if booking prior 

to cut off date 

 
I have read the conditions of this booking and except no refund is available once the booking is made.     

Parent Name: Sign: Date:   

Received By:  
Educator Name: Date booked  Apply $10 Discount Y / N   

 

---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

 
Children must be signed in and out by a nominated person.  

All payments will be Direct Debited using the account details provided.   

Parents are advised to book the required days carefully as no cancellation of booked days will be accepted.  

Excursions are non-refundable.   A permission slip must be signed for all excursions. 

 

Child’s Name  

 

Enrolment Form 

Completed  
Yes / No  

Please ensure an enrolment and booking form has been 

completed.    



Campsie Childcare Centre - OSHC Vacation Care Program 
                   

 

Monday 15th April Tuesday 16th April Wednesday 17th April Thursday 18th April Friday 19th April 

In House Excursion  In Centre  Excursion   

Wearable Art Day 

 

Bring a hat to decorate in 
your own style, a t-shirt to     

Tie-Dy. 
Get your face painted or 
Henna art on your hand. 

Create your name in 
bubble writing and make it 

as a necklace or a 
decoration. 

  

Smell the popcorn? 
Let’s check out what’s 
showing at Burwood 
Cinemas this holiday! 
 Popcorn and drinks 

included! 
 
 
 

Departure time 
9:30 am 

Returning 
3.00 pm  

Let your senses go wild! 
As you explore a different 

cuisine. Have a go at 
cooking Curry chicken and 
Pita for lunch and Crepes 

for afternoon tea.  
 
 
 
 

Test your skills at 
gardening.  Plant your own 

organic herbs and 
vegetables  

City Tour 
 

Let's take a walk through 
the city and explore some 

iconic sights 
 

Departure time 
9:30 am 

Returning 
3pm 

 
We will enjoy Hot Cross 
Buns for afternoon tea! 

  

 
 
 

GOOD  
FRIDAY 

 
Public 

Holiday 
  

Additional Cost: $0.00 Additional Cost: $22.00 Additional Cost: $8.00 Additional Cost: $10.00 Additional Cost: $0.00 

Please Bring  

• Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea  
• Lunch 
• T Shirt 

 

• Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea 
• Lunch  

• Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea 
• Lunch  

• Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea 
• Lunch  

 

 



         Campsie Childcare Centre - OSHC Vacation Care Program 

 

Monday 22nd April  Tuesday 23rd April  Wednesday 24th April  Thursday 25th April  Friday 26th April  

 In Centre  Excursion   Excursion  

 
 
 
 
 
 

Easter Monday 
 

Public  
Holiday 

 
  

Enjoy a day filled with 
Easter Fun! 

Come dressed up in fancy 
dress 

Make your own Easter 
hats. 

Enjoy a Easter eggs hunt, 
Bean bag toss, 
Jumping Sacks, 

Egg and spoon race and 
Egg dying 

 
 Bake your own  Easter 

biscuits and create a 
rabbit using Fruit and 

vegetables for afternoon 
tea   

Kingpin Bowling 
 

 
 

Today we will travel to 
Kingpin Bowling at Darling 
Harbour! Take a strike and 
become the next bowling 

champion. 
 

Departure time 
9:30 am 

Returning 
3pm 

  

 
 
 
 
 

Anzac Day 
 

Public Holiday 
 
  

Exploring Autumn 
 

Let’s go on a nature walk 
to our local parks.  Collect 
various natural materials 
and use your imagination 
to create animal shapes 

and designs! 
 
 

Departure time 
10.00am  

Returning 
11.30am  

 
Put on a circus act and 
participate I a variety of 

circus acts 

 Additional Cost: $5.00 Additional Cost: $20.00  Additional Cost: $0.00 

Please Bring 

 • Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea 
• Lunch 

• Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea 
• Lunch 

 • Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea 
• Lunch 



 

Campsie Childcare Centre - OSHC Vacation Care Program 

 

 

Monday 29th April  Tuesday 30th April 

In Centre   

Hands on experiments for ‘Little Einsteins’! 
Witness a bubble explosion! Learn how carbon dioxide creates bubble 

reactions. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Create your own Crystals 
Experiment with velocity 

And locomotive 
 

Mini Soccer Clinic 
  

Back to school 
 

Before/After school care operating as normal 

Additional Cost: $3.00  

Please Bring  

• Drinking bottle 
• Morning tea 
• Lunch 

 


